
Z412

GET OUT TO 
THE RALLY

Established by the A. S. U. N.

B^ugebtosb
Founded October 19, 1893.

IT’S THT LAST ONE 
THIS FALL

w— - —yJ

1

VOL. LIII No. 7 UNIVERSITY OF NEVADA, RENO, FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 8, 1946

WOLVES MEET SANTA BARBARA STATE
Moseley Reveals j
Building Status
To Student Group

Five-Year Project 
Discussed in Full 
At Joint Meeting

“Release by the interim board 
of the $350,000 alloted by the 
state legislature two years ago, 
is the only matter delaying con­
struction of the new classroom 
building on the lower campus,” 
stated Dr. John O. Moseley, uni­
versity president, in a meeting 
of the student improvement 
committee yesterday in his office.

President’s 
Five-Year Plan

As a highlight of the meeting 
President Moseley outlined his 
five-year building and improve­
ments plan for the university 
campus, with the aid of his min­
iature relief map and model 
buildings to represent the pres­
ent structures and those to be 
added.

“First on the agenda is the 
new classroom building. Two 
years ago the $350,000, autho­
rized by the legislature, would 
have constructed an elaborate 
three-story 20-classroom build­
ing. But now, all we can expect 
for that price is a building with 
simple classrooms and no equip­
ment. More funds will be need­
ed for equipment,” stated Uresi- 
dent Moseley.

New Heating Plant
The second building to be con­

structed as part of the five-year 
plan, approved in a recent meet­
ing of the board of regents, is 
the badly needed heating plant, 
“Our present heating system is 
40 per cent overtaxed,” Presi­
dent Moseley declared, “and we 
certainly can’t count on it to sup­
ply heat to any additional build­
ings.”

As the third proposed struc­
ture the life science building is 
needed to add classroom and lab­
oratories to the applied science 
schools. The agriculture depart­
ment cannot expand to keep 
abreast of the developments in 
agronomy, soil experimentation, 
and range economic studies. 
President experimental labora­
tories for botany, horticulture 
and bacterior studies are “on a 
par with some of our state high 
school laboratories and no bet­
ter,” emphasized President Mos­
ley.

Engineering Wing
In order for the engineering 

department to handle the pres­
ent over-grown lower classes as 
they advance into upper classes 
plus the additional burden of 
large freshman classes, the en­
gineering building must have a 
wing added. If the university 
ever expects to have all its en­
gineering- courses accredited 
more adequate facilities must be 
provided.

University Must Expand
“This proposed $1,500,000 

building program sounds too 
rich for the state’s blood at pres­
ent, but the meager income of 
$300,000 from the state for sup­
port of the university just won’t 
cover the necessary improve­
ments required to properly edu­
cate Nevada’s growing popula­
tion of young people. I believe 
the population of Nevada will 
double within 10 years, and if 
the releases of the Veterans Ad­
ministration are at all accurate 
veteran enrollment, according to 
them, will not reach its peak 
until 1950. We must expand to 
meet that influx of students,” 
stated President Moseley.

Student Backing Needed
In reply to the question, “What 

can the student body do to back 
you ip putting this plan into ef­
fect ” asked by Henry Stew­
art, chairman of the student im­
provement committee, President 
Moseley asked them to use their

(Continued on Page 6)

Hinckley Elected 
Alumni President

Wayne Hinckley of Reno was 
elected president of the Univer­
sity Alumni Association last Sat­
urday evening at the annual ban­
quet held at the Dutch Garden. 
He succeeds John Chism, also 
of Reno.

Mr. Hinckley, Associated Oil 
distributor in Reno, was a mem­
ber of the class of 1926. He was 
president of his freshman class 
and also served as varsity foot­
ball manager while on the 
campus.

Louis Weiner, president of the 
newly organized southern Ne­
vada chapter of the association, 
was elected vice-president. Mr. 
Weiner, a 1937 graduate, is now 
a practicing attorney in Las 
Vegas. A head yell leader while 
at Nevada, Weiner was also ac­
tive in Blue Key and served on 
numerous student committees.

Bruce Bowen May 
Be Nevada Choice 
For Rhodes Study

1946 Grad-Army Officer
Is Only Applicant
For Scholarship

YWCA Presents 
Assembly Program 
On November 13

Vivian Davis in Charge 
Of Entirely New 
Ski Program

Robert Bruce Bowen, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Bowen of 
Reno, and a graduate of the uni­
versity, will probably be select­
ed as Nevada’s representative 
for Rhodes Scholarship advanc­
ed study program at Oxford Uni­
versity in England, Doctor John 
O. Moseley, university president 
and secretary of the Nevada 
Rhodes Scholarship selection 
committee, said this week.

As Bowen’s application was 
the only one received in Nevada 
the state selection committee 
will probably endorse his appli­
cation .at their meeting on De­
cember 12 and following this en­
dorsement Bowen’s application 
will be placed on the agenda of 
the district committee as a pros­
pective representative from the 
seventh district,

Bowen was graduated from 
the University of Nevada in Au­
gust of 1946 completing his re­
quirements in the second sum­
mer session. His career at the 
university began in 1940 follow­
ing his graduation from Reno 
high school. During his stay at 
Nevada he served as junior class 
president, president of Blue Key 
service organization, participat­
ed on the intercollegiate debate 
team and was active in Lambda 
Chi Alpha fraternity,

In 1943 Bowen left the uni­
versity to accept an appointment 
to the United States Military 
Academy at West Point. Com­
pleting the three-year accelerat­
ed program he was graduated 
and appointed a second lieuten­
ant in the field artillery in June 
of 1946. He is now stationed at 
Fort Sill, Oklahoma.

Bowen majored in English and 
minored in history at the univer­
sity. His ambition is to serve the 
United States in a foreign dip­
lomatic capacity. For this reason 
he has long desired to go to Eng­
land as a Rhodes scholar to learn 
more about the British Empire, 
its governmental policies and its 
philosophical attitude. If he is 
selected by the seventh district, 
composed of Nevada, California, 
Utah, Arizona, Colorado and 
New Mexico, he plans to study 
philosophy, politics and econom­
ics at Oxford.
TRI-DELT, LAMBDA CHI 
DANCES HOLD SPOTLIGHT

Delta Delta Delta will hold a 
carnival dance Saturday night 
for all chapter members and 
their dates.

The annual Lambda Chi Al­
pha baby dance will be held Sat­
urday nip'ht at Lawton’s.

Entertainment for the student 
body assembly to be held Wed­
nesday, November 13, promises 
to be new and different. It will 
be something never before tried 
on the University of Nevada 
campus and will be given by the 
YWCA girls under the chair­
manship of Vivian Davis. Miss 
Barbara Thompson, secretary of 
YWCA, states that the theme of 
the skits will not be disclosed in 
advance.

Thiss assembly will take place 
at 10 am in the new gym, with 
classes dismissed. In the past, 
classes were not dismissed but 
shortened, and assemblies took 
place every Friday. In the fu­
ture the meetings will be few 
and far between, but according 
to Hans Wolfe, student body 
president, they will be better as­
semblies with a full class hour 
time.

Business to be transacted at 
this student body gathering will 
be the award for the best attend­
ance at the Homecoming dance 
last Saturday night.

Freshman and sophomore 
class managers will take their 
oath of office, and the award for 
the girls’ scholarship will be । 
presented.

Henry Stewart, chairman of 
the student improvement com­
mittee, will give a report on the 
activities of his group.

While the assembly is in ses­
sion the library and snack bar 
will not be open for business, 
Wolfe said.

STEWART HALL 
BASEMENT CLOSED 
FOR ASSEMBLIES

A request from the student 
body council that the basement 
of Stewart Hall be closed dur­
ing assemblies is to be granted, 
Barbara Thompson, secretary of 
YWCA, announced today.

In the future both the recrea­
tion room and the snack bar will 
be closed any time assemblies 
are being held. The student body 
council hopes to encourage a 
larger student attendance at as­
semblies by closing these popu­
lar meeting places of the delin­
quents.

SAGERS PROGRAM 
SALES ANNOUNCED

Two thousand football pro­
grams were sold at the Home- 
coming game Saturday by the 
Sagers, campus service organi­
zation, Bill Buck, Sager presi­
dent, said today.

This organization, which has 
been instrumental in carrying 
out numerous services to aid 
both students and the campus in 
general, proudly displays the 
Wolves Frolic trophy which it 
won for having the best organi­
zational skit. The title of their 
skit was “The Men in Her Life.”

NEW GYMNASIUM
IS ARRANGED FOR 
SIMULTANEOUS SPORTS

The new gym is now arranged 
so basketball, volley ball and 
badminton may be played at one 
time. This was made possible by 
installing four new portable 
basketball backboards, reports 
Professor John E. Martie, head 
of the PE department.

These backboards can be mov­
ed to any position, making vari­
ous combinations of floor space 
available.

“Doc” Martie said that two 
basketball games will be played 
at one time when freshman ball 
starts.

Women Athletes 
To Be Decorated 
At WRA Dinner

A sports award dinner and 
initiation into Women’s Recrea­
tional Association will be held 
November 14 at 5 pm, Billie Ken­
nedy, president of the associa­
tion, announced today.

Women students who have re­
ceived participation credits in ri- 
fler" horseback riding and ten­
nis, will be initiated into the as­
sociation, and members who 
have been recognized as out- 
standin" in these two sports will 
receive awards at that time. 
Names of those women who are 
to be initiated and to receive 
awards have not been announced 
as yet.

Dorothy Thompson heads the 
committee for initiation activi­
ties and Barbara Olesen is chair­
man of the food committee.

Two-Man Squads 
Represent Nevada 
In Debate Meet

Experience To Be Gained 
In Individual Events at 
Compton College

Five two-man squads will rep­
resent the University of Nevada 
at the debate tournament to be 
held Friday, November 15, at 
Compton College in Los An­
geles, Mr. S. H: Vinocour, de­
bate instructorj said today. The 
meet is sponsored by the South­
ern California Tournament As­
sociation.

Although they will not take 
part in the debates, Nevada rep­
resentatives will perform in in­
dividual events. These include 
extemporaneous speaking, im­
promptu speaking, oratory and 
dramatic interpretation.

Attendance at the southern 
tournament will be primarily to 
give the debaters experience in 
tournament procedure and to 
serve as preparation for the con­
test to be held in San Francis­
co on November 25, 26 and 27. 
Sponsored by the Western As­
sociation of Teachers of Speech, 
all schools and colleges west of 
the Rocky Mountains may com­
pete in this San Francisco tour­
nament.

Those planning to enter ex­
temporaneous and impromptu 
contests at the southern Cali­
fornia tournament will be Mac- 
lin Sumners, Jack Millinger, Hu- 
ling Ussery and Arthur John­
son. Rex Jemison, Bruce An­
derson and Jack Diehl will 
speak extemporaneously, while 
Gordon Hawkins and Scott 
Whitney will take part in the 
impromptu speaking and ora­
tory.

Nevada will be the only out- 
of-California school in attend­
ance at the tournament. Other 
colleges will be Redlands, Po­
mona, College of Pacific, Uni­
versity of Southern California, 
University of California at Los 
Angeles, Los Angeles City Col­
lege, Occidental College, San 
Jose State Teachers’ College, 
San Diego State, California In­
stitute of Technology and Comp­
ton College.

MONDAY MORNING 
CLASSES OUT FOR 
ARMISTICE PARADE

Morning classes at the Uni­
versity of Nevada campus will 
be dismissed Monday, Novem­
ber 11, so that students and fac­
ulty members can participate in 
Armistice Day exercises. The 
decision was made at a meeting 
of the administration council 
Friday, November 1.

Afternoon classes will be 
scheduled as usual on Armistice 
Day.

Senators Plan 
New Official 
Bulletin Board

Students’ Status 
To Be Clarified 
In Near Future

At the bi-annual joint meet­
ing of the senate and adminis­
trative council of the Universi­
ty of Nevada on Wednesday 
night the suggestion was made 
that another bulletin board be 
erected for official notices only. 
Heretofore the posting of a no­
tice on the bulletin board was 
considered sufficient for every­
one on the campus, but the sug­
gestion was made that notices 
coming from an official source be 
read in classes.

Clarification of the class stat­
us of certain students was dis­
cussed. It has been found that 
difficulty in classifying students 
exists all over the country. The 
problem is being worked on and 
students will be able to obtain 
their correct classification in the 
near future.

Parking regulations on cam­
pus were discussed and it was 
brought out that the administra­
tion is behind the regulations 
as they exist at the present time.

Streamlining registration so 
that it can be completed in less 
time and more efficiently was a 
topic for discussion.

Dr. John O. Moseley address­
ed the joint meeting and spoke 
of the need for close coopera­
tion among students, administra­
tion and faculty. He stressed the 
noint that nothing can be accom­
plished without this cooperation.

Henry Stewart, student chair­
man of the improvement com­
mittee gave a report on what the 
students are anxious to have ac­
complished in the way of im­
provements on campus.

U of Hawaii Y’s 
To Back Wolves

Cheers, yells and songs for the 
Wolf Pack at the University of 
Nevada-University of Hawaii 
game at Honolulu on December 
7, will be given by YMCA and 
YWCA members of the Univer­
sity of Hawaii. This announce­
ment was made by Barbara 
Thompson, YWCA secretary, for 
Arthur Wong, president of the 
YMCA at the University of 
Hawaii.

In a letter to Miss Thompson, 
Wong said, “In less than two 
months now, the University of 
Nevada football team will visit 
the islands to play the Univer­
sity of Hawaii in the annual 
Pineapple Bowl game. Due to 
the great distance between Ne­
vada and Hawaii, it will be al­
most impossible for your team 
to be accompanied by any size­
able rooting section. It is our de­
sire, however, to see that your 
team finds some encouragement 
and reminder that they are fight­
ing hard to uphold the honor of 
Nevada.

“We are requesting, therefore, 
that you, Barbara, send us copies 
of some of your songs and yells 
so that we here at the YM- 
YWCA may form some sort of 
rooting section for your team.”

SUBMIT CONSTITUTIONS

All organizations on the 
campus which were inac­
tive during the war years, 
and which desire to be rein­
stated to their former stat­
us, must resubmit their con­
stitutions at the office of the 
ASUN president. The an­
nouncement was made today 
by Hans Wolfe, student 
body president

Blue Key Dance 
To Follow Rally

A pep rally is scheduled for 
Friday night starting at the 
Gamma Phi Beta house at 7 pm 
with a torch parade which leads 
to the new gymnasium where 
there will be a rally followed by 
a Blue Key dance.

The torches for the parade are 
being furnished by 'the Sagers. 
At the rally, the Sigma Nu fra­
ternity will present a skit, accord­
ing to Bob Durham, master of 
ceremonies. Immediately after 
the rally the Blue Key dance will 
begin.

Pack Trek South
Cancelled; No
Penalties Meted

Miss. State-Nevada
Deadlocked Over
Racial Problem

Controversy over the Univer­
city of Nevada-Mississippi State 
football game that was to be 
played November 16 was 
brought to a close November 4 
when a wire from C. R. Noble, 
Mississippi State athletic direc­
tor, was received stating that, 
“it is satisfactory with Mississip­
pi State for Nevada to cancel 
our game with no penalty to ac­
crue to either school.”

This was in reply to the Uni­
versity of Nevada’s wire that 
was drawn up by the athletic I 
board, and sent to the Mississippi 
State officials on November 4. 
The wire read as follows:

Wire Read
“At a meeting of the board of 

athletic control of the Univer­
sity of Nevada held on Novem­
ber 4, 1946, your wire of Novem­
ber 1, 1946, was read. After due 
consideration of your letter and 
lire and after receiving legal ad­
vice, our board of athletic con­
trol is of the opinion that it is 
impossible for us to reach any 
mutual agreement. Therefore, 
the board of athletics voted to 
cancel our game with no penalty 
to accrue to either school. We 
would appreciate your immedi­
ate telegraphic agreement to 
this arrangement.”

The difference was initiated as 
a result of southern customs in 
athletic competition, and the re­
action of the original wire that 
was sent by the Mississippi State 
officiols. The wire read as fol­
lows :

Old Southern Custom
“I am sure that you are fa­

miliar with southern customs re­
garding Negroes, and you prob­
ably have in mind not to, play 
them in our game; because if 
they were to attempt to play, it 
would cause considerable com­
motion.”

Several universities have fol­
lowed the University of Neva­
da’s example in cancelling sched­
uled games with southern uni­
versities.

SUGAR WILL SOON 
AGAIN FLAVOR SNACK 
BAR COFFEE AGAIN

Fervent hallelujahs will soon 
be heard in the YWCA snack 
bar when sugar, which has been 
absent from coffee cups for sev­
eral weeks, will reappear, Mrs. 
Winona Earl, snack bar chair­
man, stated this week that there 
will be sugar “any day now.”

According to Mrs. Earl, snack 
bar volunteers are now serving 
approximately 300 students a 
day.

They consume the sugar allot­
ment in short order.

Plans are now being made to 
secure a cigarette machine for 
the basement recreation center.

One-Win Gauchos 
Battle Wolves 
On Mackay Turf

Visitors Hope to- Stop 
Aerial Attack 
Of Nevada

By Gene Evans
Nevada’s Wolf Pack will be 

after its fifth win of the year 
tomorrow when it goes up 
against a game, but luckless 
Santa Barbara State eleven on 
the Mackay stadium turf at 
2 :30 pm. The Wolves, passin’est 
in the country, coming off of the 
sloppy showing against Montana 
State last weekend, will be out 
to redeem themselves in the eyes 
of their followers.

Santa Barbara’s Gauchos, on 
the other hand, having hit the 
win column but once this year, 
will be all out to join the “upset” 
bandwagon. Sporting as beefy a 
forward wall as any team to meet 
the Wolves to date, the Santa 
Barbarans hope to stop the 
Pack’s ground game and then 
beat them at their trade—pass­
ing.

Iffy Question
However, IF the Gauchos can 

muster an attack via the air to 
remotely resemble the Nevada 
aerial circus they will be do­
ing SOMETHING. Last com­
pilation of national standings of 
major football clubs, places the 
Wolves on top of the heap, and 
if the Santa Barbara team is to 
scale the lofty heights, their 
work is cut out for them.

Reports from scouts indicate 
that the Californians have ap­
peared disorganized in their past 
encounters, but Coach Jim Ai­
ken, Nevada guiding light, made 
known in a recent interview that 
Santa Barbara is just the type 
team to come alive against his 
Silver and Blue club. Stan Wil­
liamson, Gaucho mentor, is a 
smart man, and I’m looking for 
anything to happen where he is 
concerned. It’s a known fact that 
Nevada has been put down as 
a ‘special event’ in his little black 
book,” said Aiken. “But we are 
not going to let it be a red let­
ter day for him, if we can help 
it.”

Stress Defense
Concentrating on their own 

running game, the Wolves, nev­
ertheless, found time the past 
week to stress defense, both 
ground and overhead. Remark­
ed Aiken, “We have a strong 
group of running- backs, but our 
passing game has been the main­
stay of the team so far. It’s con­
ceivable that our passing attack 
will backfire one of these days 
and when it does I want some­
thing else to fall back on. I hope 
that Saturday won’t be the day, 
but if it is, then our backs will 
be ready to take over.”

Former Opponents
The Santa Barbara lineup 

when it takes the field tomorrow 
will have several men who previ­
ously had football experience at 
the University of Nevada. Fore­
most among this group is Frank 
Kirkland, 230 pound center. 
Kirkland turned out for spring 
football training last year be­
fore deciding to enroll at the 
California school.

The Gaucho lineup: Ends, 
Peters and Paulson; tackles, 
Bowman and Golson; guards, 
Kirkland; quarterback, Billing- 
er; halfbacks, Patton and Cath­
art ; fullback, Miller.

The Wolfe Pack Probable 
lineup: Ends, Gillom and Beas­
ley; tackles, McClure and Shar­
key ; guards, Tilton and Sinof- 
sky; center, Sprague; quarter­
back, Mackrides; halfbacks, 
Bass and Kalmanir; fullback, 
Rude.
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Molly Malone, Russell 
Among Victors in 
GOP Landslide
Eleven former students and 

graduates of the University of 
Nevada won recognition in the 
November 5 election. Most of 
these men were running on the 
Republican ticket and came 
through with victories.

Former student, George W. 
(Molly) Malone, Republican, de­
feated Berkeley L. Bunker for 
the seat in the U. S. senate. “Mol­
ly” Malone was a student from 
1913 to 1917, left school to en­
list in the army as a private in 
World War I. He served over­
seas in the AEF as a lieutenant, 
after having worked his way up 
through the ranks.

After the war, Malone return­
ed to the university to continue 
his course of engineering. Dur­
ing his college career Mr. Ma­
lone was captain of the football

Wilson.

The opinions expressed in the editorials of the Sagebrush are 
those of the editor and do not necessarily reflect the viewpoint fo 
any other individual or of any campus organization.

• team and baseball squad and won 
I the amateur middleweight box- 
, ing championship of the Paci- 
i fic coast for the university. Sena-

University Singers 
To Present Program

The university singers will 
present a program at the Reno 
Repertoire Club Monday, No­
vember 11, at the home of F. B. 
Headley, 432 Court street.

The program, under the di­
rection of Professor Theodore H. 
Post, will include "Sweet Prom­
ised Land of Nevada,” sung by 
Alberto Barrios with entire 
group.

The words for this song are 
by Walter Van Tilberg Clark, 
son of former University of Ne- 
"vada President Dr. Walter E. 
Clark, and are taken from his 
book, “The City of Trembling 
Leaves.” The music setting is by 
Professor Post.

Other numbers on the program 
will include the “Bells of St. 
Mary’s” by the men’s group, 
“Waltzing in the Clouds'” and 
“Carioca” by the women’s group 
and “Waltzing Matilda” by both 
groups. Solos by Nona Lee Tut­
tle, Bud Hardesty, Leslie Har­
vey and Esther Gordon will also 
be presented.

Professor Post said that since 
the space in the home of Mr. 
Headley is limited, only half of 
the university group will take 
part.

CHINESE GRADS 
STUDY MINING 
AT UNIVERSITY

Sent by Government 
In Exchange Policy 
With Uncle Sam

JUST MARK TWO

tor-elect Malone is a member of 
the Sigma Alpha Epsilon fra­
ternity.

In the other federal govern­
ment post the Republicans scor-

Along with the several other races on the ballot this week ed again when they elected 
was for the low men on the totem pole—-Mario Recanzone and . Charles H. Russell, editor of the
regents. General campus sentiment, so far as we can determine, ' Ely Record to the U. S. house 
was for the low man on the totem pole—Mario Recanzone and of representatives. Mr. Russell,
Paul Sirkegian. Several frats and other organizations went on 
record as supporting the candidacy of these two men because 
of first-hand knowledge of their abilities. Sirkegian, an incum­
bent, had already achieved a creditable record as a regent.

Both men were soundly defeated, however. It doesn’t take 
much master-minding to figure out why.

Several people whom we didn’t see until after the elections— 
people who have no connection with the campus—were asked 
their choices in the race. They gave us the blank-stare treat­
ment, and then replied, “Well, I votd for the first two names on 
the ballot. It’s kind of an honorary job anyway, isn’t it?”

Now, the campaigning is all over, and the might-have-been 
angle is dead. Mr. Cahlan. and Mr. Hilliard very possibly will be 
highly competent regents—at least, there is no evidence to the 
contrary and in running for the job they have indicated an interest 
in campus, affairs. They should be given every cooperation.

But that isn’t the point. The business of voting for the first 
two men, and the additional comment about the “honorary posi­
tion” are sad commentaries on the beclouded role of the job in 
the mind of the average voter.

Somehow the point must be gotten across that the board of 
regents are a big factor in running the university. The public 
should be enlightened about the responsibilities and duties of 
the positions. It is the board of regents, together with the presi­
dent, who ask for legislative appropriations; that group has a lot 
to say about determining policy at this university.

They are administrators, administrators who hold tremendous 
power in shaping the university. It is high time they were regarded 
as such by the people who elect them, and not as sort of a board 
of visitors who are in the running for the prestige.

of representatives. Mr. Russell,
a former student at the univer­
sity, defeated Malcolm M-cEach- 
in, Democrat, for the position.

’32 Grad Wins
On the local scene Republican 

Harold Taber, 1932 graduate 
and former assistant district at­
torney, won the post of district 
attorney over Gordon Rice, 
Democrat.

Six assemblymen were chos­
en for the Nevada state legisla­
ture from among former stu­
dents. All are Republicans. Lead­
ing the parade are E. Frandsen, 
“Bud” Loomis, 1936 graduates;

William Beemer, 1934 graduate, 
former president of th e Univer­
sity of Nevada Alumni Associa­
tion : Louis Capurro, 1940 gradu­
ate ; Carl Fuetsch, class of 1929; 
Marvin Humphries, 1931 gradu­
ate, and Francis “Tank” Smith, 
class of 1932.

Republican Harry J. Dun- 
seath, graduate of 1933, won the 
justice of the peace.

Elected to the board of re­
gents for the University of Ne­
vada was John F. Cahlan, class 
of 1926.

The lion-political position of 
hospital trustee was won by Dr. 
W. W. Hall, football team physi­
cian, for the short term.

Liang-Chiu Chow, Hornier 
Lee and Ven-Chung Lee, mining 
engineer graduates from Chinese 
universities, are visiting the Uni­
versity of Nevada campus to 
study and practice for a year in 
the United States.

Sent here by the Chinese gov­
ernment as a result of a policy 
of student exchange with the 
Chinese and the United States 
governments, they left their 
families behind to accept this op­
portunity. All three men held 
jobs in a copper mine in China.

At present they are stationed 
at the United States Bureau of 
Mines Metallurgy building on 
the campus and can be seen 
spending most of their time in 
the library of the Mackay School 
of Mines.

Speak at Meet
Last Wednesday the three 

spoke at a meeting of Associated 
Engineering students. Thursday 
noon they lectured downtown at 
a luncheon of the American In-

' 'H,

FOR FINE

< China, Glass Gifts 
and Electrical

; Appliances

This 
Gentleman 
Is Smiling

Because 
We Have 
Cleaned 
His Suit

We are easy on 
your clothes.

Let us save you 
money.

Prompt deliv­
ery and smiling 
service is the 

secret of our 
success.

THE ONLY SOLUTION

An editorial on the Mississippi State cancellation now seems 
superfluous, as the story broke all over the country in the early 
part of the week and dozens of editors and sports writers have 
had their say.

The athletic board of control made the only move possible. 
There is no argument about that; indeed, any other decision 
would have been greeted with hoots and catcalls not only here, 
but throughout the country.

Gillom and Bass, in addition to being a very large share of 
the football team, are students—participating for the university 
in an extra-curricular activity. With football commercialized to 
its current degree that angle is easily forgotten. It’s there, never­
theless; and to allow discrimination against them would be a black 
eye against Nevada.

Fresno State really blazed the trail this time; their unfortu­
nate experience, in just barely having time to lodge a student body 
protest before the teams took the field, was a great teacher. The 
Staters had_to play, sans their Negro performer; fortunately. 
Nevada didn’t.

The athletic board of control acted promptly and properly. 
The lesson to be learned out of the whole mess is—don’t schedule 
the deep south colleges.

The Mississippians can’t really be blamed for their attitude; 
you don’t change centuries of prejudice for one football game. 
But, so long as their racial views are incompatible with ours, 
there should be no ffurther relations between this school and those 
with the southern “traditions” to uphold.

> <
155 North Virginia 

Reno, Nevada <

a

Jessie Taylor 
Myers

OPTOMETRIST

New Frat Pledges 
Named This Week 
By Dean's Office

The list of new fraternity 
pledges was announced by Dr. 
Robert S. Griffin, dean of men, 
today.

The Theta Chi’s have pledged 
the most with 19 new men. Sig­
ma Nu is next with six men; 
then Alpha Tau Omega with 
four; Phi Sigma Kappa and Sig­
ma Alpha Epsilon have each 
claimed two new pledges; with 
Lambda Chi Alpha and Sigma 
Rho Delta pledging one each.

Theta Chi’s list of pledges in­
cludes Robert R. Allen, Walter 
Case, Thomas M . Ekel, Man­
ford Hardesty, Tom L. Jolly, 
Paul C. Lepori, Robert H. Lin­
ka, Robert C. Martin, John F.

Milburn, Joe Moore, Elmer 
Prima, LaMar R. Smith, Earl 
Reimers, Harley R. Woodworth, 
Wallace D. Spencer, Alex V. 
Rassuchine, Philip E. Whitmer, 
Richard R. McDermid, Robert 
McCrae.

Sigma Nu pledged Jules Ben­
bow, Floyd Gori, James L. 
Moell, James T. Smith, Eugene 
Sprout, David W. Towner.

Those pledged by Alpha Tau 
Omega were Alan Dondero, Earl 
C. Freemont,v John Brice Leg­
gett, Louis Steve Mendive.

Phi Sigma Kappa chose Rob­
ert W. Calvert and Leonard 
Marmor.

Sigma Alpha Epsilon pledged 
John W. Patterson and Robert 
Patrick.

Lambda Chi Alpha and Sigma 
Rho Delta pledged Morgan J. I 
Sweeney, Jr., and Harold Nellis, I 

'.respectively.

stitution of Mines.
Hornier Lee, 1935 graduate 

from the Tsing-Hua University 
at Peiping, is a special student 
in geology.

Liang-Chiu Chow and Ven- 
Chung Lee, graduates from the 
Chao-Tung University at Tang- 
San in 1937, are special students 
in their respective fields of met­
allurgy and ore dressing.

Jay A. Carpenter, professor 
and head of the department of 
mining engineering, said that the 
Mackay School of Mines has 
had several Chinese graduates.

Society
CLEANERS & TAILORS

229 West Second Street 
Phone 3421

From time to time there 
been several prominent 
neers as is included in the 
ent group.

have 
engi- 
pres-

THERE IS A DIFFERENCE in

Kodak Finishing
For quality developing and 
printing take your films to the

Nevada 
Photo Service 

253-255 Sierra Street 
and get them the 
Panel-Art Way

“What a dear little boy! And 
what is his name?”

“His name is Joe, but we call 
him Flannel for short.”

“Indeed?”
“Yep. He shrinks from wash­

ing.”

WINE HOUSE
18 East Commercal Row 

Phone 5821

—Our Specialty—

Fried Chicken 
and Steaks

WE RAISE ’EM
YOU EAT ’EM

Hotel El Cortez

5:

£

RENO, NEVADA $ 

The Riverside | 
NEVADA’S FINEST HOTEL X

Arthur V. Allen, Mgr. y

Hotel Golden !
NEVADA’S LARGEST AND X
MOST POPULAR HOTEL $

Recently Remodeled and X
Refurnished Throughout X

TEarl W. Harrington, Asst. Mgr. T
Gordon A. Davey, Asst. Mgr. $
The above hotels are owned 
and operated by Reno Securi- Y 
ties Co. X

369 Medico-Dental Bldg. 
Telephone 3362

Analytical Eye Examination 
Training in Visual Skills

Reno Laundry and Dry Cleaning
We Call and Deliver at Your Convenience

205 PLAZA STREET TELEPHONE 5471

Rooms from $3.00

Banquet Facilities 
COFFEE SHOP

Home of the

Trocadero
Popular Priced 

COCKTAIL LOUNGE

Excellent Food
Dancing Nightly

♦ t Never a Cover Charge £

FIRST 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Cor. Second and Chestnut Sts.
—Sunday Evening Schedule—
6:00.
6:30.
6:45.
7:15.
8:00.

..... Supper 
Fellowship 
... Vespers 
...  Forums 
....... Close

Ministe, Rev. Earl S. Barnett

ST. THOMAS AQUINAS 
CATHEDRAL

310 West Second Street
Sunday Masses: 6, 8, 9:30 am, 

12 noon.
Confessions: Saturday after­

noon 3-5; Sat. evening 7-9. 
Newman Club the second Sun­

day of each month.
Clergy: Rev. John T. Smith, 
Rector: Rev. John Durocher, 
Rev. Bernard McDonough.

YOU ARE WELCOME AT
FIRST 

METHODIST CHURCH
Home of Wesley Foundation

First at West Street
9:45 Church School 

11 am, Radio Sermon, KOH 
6:30 pm, Wesley Foundation 
7:30 pm. Evening Devotion

Ministers—Don S. Fleming 
and Vincent W. Watson

FIRST CHURCH OF 
CHRIST, SCIENTIST 

501 Riverside Avenue

SUNDAY SERVICES 
11 am and 8 pm
ADAM AND 

FALLEN MAN
WEDNESDAY EVENING

Testimony Meeting at 8 pm

Reno’s Movie Calender for Next Week
MAJESTIC

Sunday-Friday
November 10-15

To Each
HIS OWN

OLIVIA DE HAVILLAND 
JOHN LUND

Saturday
Novemlber 16

Till
The End
Of Time

DOROTHY McGUIRE 
GUY MADISON

GRANADA
Sunday-Wednesday 

November 10-13

Centennial
Summer

JEANNE CRAIN
CORNEL WILDE

Thursday—November 14

BRONZE MATRONS 
PRESENTATION

Friday-Saturday
November 15-16

Strange Love of 
Martha Ivers

BARBARA STANWYCK
VAN HEFLIN

NEVADA
Sun.-Tues.—Nov. 10-12

Badman’s Territory
R. Scott- Ann Richards

Strange Conquest
Jane Wyatt Lowell Gilmore

Wed.-Thurs.—Nov. 13-14

Dark Corner
Lucille Ball Wm. Bendix

Under Fiesta Stars
Gene Autry

TOWER
Sun.-Tues.—Nov. 10-12

From This Day 
Forward

Mark Stevens Joan Fontaine

Wed.-Thurs.—Nov. 13-14

Devotion

RENO
Sun., Mon.—Nov. 10, 11

Swiss Family 
Robinson

Thomas Mitchell Edna Best

Silver Devil 
Calidonia

Tues., Wed.—Nov. 12-13
Masquerade in 

Mexico
D. Lamour A. De Cordova

The Suspect
C. Laughton Ella Raines

Fri.-Sat.—Nov. 15-16

Ann Savage Tom Neal

R. Cummings 
Audrey Long

B. Stanwyck 
John Loder

Sat.—Nov. 16
Detour

O. De Havilland Ida Lupino

Inside Job
P. Foster Ann Rutherford

Glass Alib'
Paul Kelly Anne Gwynne

Riverboat Rhythm
Leon Erro! Glenn Vernon

Fri.-Sat.—Nov. 15-16

Thtirs., Fri.—Nov. 14, 15
Hollywood Canteen

All Star Cast

Danger Woman
Brenda Joyce Don Porter

Bride Wore Boots 
Game of Death Blazing Western 

Trails
Charles Starett
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Greeks Get Back 
In Social Swing 
Following H’ Day

Social life is getting back to 
normal on the hill following the 
activity filled Homecoming 
weekend.

The ATOs and Phis will get 
together at a social next Wed­
nesday at the Tau house. On Fri­
day night the Tans will hold 
their annual coconuts dance. 
Last weekend they entertained 
alumni at an open house follow­
ing the Wolves Frolic and on 
Saturday honored former ATO 
members at a luncheon. Approxi­
mately 60 alumni were present.

Gamma Phi Beta will be en­
tertained by Sigma Rho on Sun­
day at Lincoln Hall. The Gam­
ma Phis will also hold a “coed 
hour” from 3 to 5 every Friday, 
all Gamma Phis and their guests 
will attend.

The province director of Pi 
Beta Phi visited the Nevada 
chapter from Wednesday until 
Friday of this week. Pi Phi alum­
nae were entertained at a lunch­
eon last Saturday at the Colom­
bo. Some 85 alums were present.

Kappa Alpha Theta will be 
the guests of SAE at a social 
on Thursday night and next 
Thursday the Pi Phis will be 
honored by the fraternity. Open 
house for alums was held by 
Sigma Alpha Epsilon before and

BEE & BEE SNACK SERVICE 
Is Here for You

SANDWICHES - CAKE - FRUIT 
CIGARETTES - CANDY - MILK 

Brought to you in the evenings 
between hours of 9 pm to 11 pm

WEB BROWN

RESOURCES OVER $100,000,000

• TAKE GOOD CARE OF YOUR EYES

DR. N. B. JOSEPH
OPTOMETRIST

156 NORTH VIRGINIA STREET • RENO

• COMPLETE OPTICAL SERVICE
Participate in school activities.

JUNIOR VARSITY BALL 
DROPPED FOR SEASON

Patronize the snack bar.

Need

Fountain Pens

Come in and See Our

FRATERNITY

PHILIP MORRIS
STATIONERY

ARMANKO OFFICE SUPPLY CO
152 North Virginia Street

TWO STORES 
TO SERVE YOU

Be

ALWAYS BETTER...BETTER ALL WAYS

CANNAN’S
Drug & Floral Company 

CORSAGES - DECORATIONS 
FLORAL DESIGNS
14 West Commercial 

Phone 7169

HILP’S 
DRUG STORE 
RENO - 127 N. Virginia Street 
SPARKS - - - 938 B Street

7
V when you smoke 

PHILIP MORRIS!

CLEAN, FRESH, PURE 
^metica^s FINEST Cigarette!

Smoke as much as you like—the flavor’s ALL 
yours, when you smoke Philip Morris/ And 
here’s why . . .

There’s an important difference in Philip 
Morris manufacture that makes Philip 
Morris taste better—smoke better—because 
it lets the FULL FLAVOR of the world’s finest 
tobaccos come through for your complete 
enjoyment—clean, fresh, pure!

Try Philip Morris—you, too, will agree 
that Philip Morris is America’s FINEST 
Cigarette!

"““"“S'

CALL 
FOR

YWCA Will Meet 
Monday for Future 
Activity Discussion

YWCA advisory board will 
meet Monday, November 11, at 
4 pm in the office of Dean Elaine 
Mobley, to discuss all campus 
activities of YWCA.

Special reports on the mem­
bership drive, WSSF, football 
concession, worship committees, 
and the snack bar will be given 
by the respective chairman of 
each committee.

Tea will be served. Decora- 
tionS are to be on a Thanksgiv­
ing theme. Co-chairmen are 
Marge Menu and Georgia Lee.

The advisory board’, composed 
of 18 Reno women, advises the 
campus YWCA cabinet. Mrs. 
John D. Bibb, president, will pre­
side over the meeting.

after the football game with ap­
proximately 45 alumni attend­
ing. The boys from Evans ave­
nue serenaded the girls at each 
of the sorority houses and dor­
mitories following their Mon­
day night meeting.

Nearly 100 Theta alums were 
guests of the active chapter at 
a chapter house luncheon Satur­
day.

Theta Chi gave a social for 
Delta Delta Delta Thursday 
night and next Friday night a 
dance will be held at the frater­
nity house. Open house was held 
by the Theta Chis following the 
football game.

JOHN BAKER

Stricter Behavior
Asked iii Library

Disorder in the university li-
brary on the part of students has 
been brought to the attention of 
the library stag who have threat­
ened to put into effect strict regu­
lations governing conduct in the 
library building.

Chief complaint from the staff 
is that students are neglecting 
to return books to the library. 
Workers in the library have even 
missed cumbersome volumes of 
encyclopedias, which are not 
permitted to be taken from the 
building.

Smoking Warned Against
Smoking is also warned 

against by the staff. It wants to 
make clear that smoking is pro­
hibited in all parts of the li­
brary building.

The staff also asked that stu­
dents learn to use the revolving 
doors without spinning- them 
too fast, jamming them,, caus­
ing too-much noise, or endanger­
ing others.

Tumbling Added 
To PE Curriculum

Tumbling has now been add­
ed to the men’s PE courses, Pro­
fessor John E. Martie, head of 
the PE department, announced 
today. This new class is held at 
3 pm on Monday, Wednesday 
and Friday, under the direction 
of Irving Hackett, student tum­
bling coach.

Students who have signed up 
so far are Alfred Hansen, Mel­
vin Winsor, Allyn Bremen and 
Bill Ryan.

“Doc” Martie said that any­
one interested in tumbling was 
welcom|e to come to class, al­
though the small room limits the 
number of participants.

Sigma Nus Team, 
SAE Bob Coughlin 
Win Cross Country

Sigma Nu surged ahead in
the race for Kinnear trophy 
points, by placing men second, 
third and fourth to win the 
Homecoming cross country team 
title last Saturday. The race was 
won by Bob Coughlin, SAE, in 
24-59.9.

Leading the Snakes to victory 
was Orsie Graves, second; Har­
vey Rose, third, and Gunther 
Bruechner fourth. Lambda Chi 
clinched second place with Dick 
Rowley finishing ninth, Eid Rob­
inson, 11th, and Eric Richards, 
12th. Sigma Alpha Epsilon took 
third, placing Coughlin first, 
John Boynton, sixth and Frank 
Rittenhouse 14th. With • Bill 
Smales coming in seventh, Al­
pha Tau Omega was fourth in 
team competition.

Despite the icy wind which 
swept over the four mile course, 
Coughlin, paced by his older 
brother J im, winner of last year’s 
race, made good time.

The course record of 21-34.2, 
set in 1928 by Fred Lohse, 
Lambda Chi, remained intact fol­
lowing Saturday’s race. The tra­
ditional “grind” began back in 
1927 when Les Clover of Sigma 
Nu broke the tape and Lambda 
Chi won team honors.

Last year the race was won by 
Jim Coughlin, unattached, in 
25.45 and Theta Chi took first 
place for the house teams.

SADDLE-SPURS RIDES
Sixteen members of Saddle 

and Spurs, women’s riding club, 
rode horseback in the Homecom­
ing Day parade Saturday. The 
girls rode in formation of four 
abreast, led by Joanne Hibbs, 
standard bearer.

Miss Ruth Russell, riding in­
structor, gave commands for 
formations which were execut­
ed as the parade progressed. Due 
to limited space only a few for­
mations were presented.

J T ■ lavem iryouts 
Now Being Held

Tryouts for the first major 
campus stage production, “The 
Tavern,” - are being held daily 
in room 106 in the hall of Eng­
lish. The tryouts, which began 
Wednesday and will be conclud­
ed next Tuesday, are open to all 
students.

Scheduled for December 17, 
18, 19, 20 and 21, George M. Co­
han’s two-act play runs the en­
tire evening. “The Tavern” is a 
farce and includes mystery, sa­
tire and romance. Director will 
be Professor William Miller. 
With a cast of 15 characters, the 
play calls for four women and 
11 men.

The Reno Little Theater has 
been secured for all major pro­
ductions and a new seating sys­
tem has been adopted. All uni­
versity students will be able to 
secure free reserved sat tickets 
by presenting their student body 
cards. Seats which are left after 
students receive theirs will be 
sold to townspeople at $1 plus 
tax.

Capacity seating at the theater 
for the five nights will offer a 
total of 1,500 tickets for distribu­
tion.

Handel’s Messiah 
Set for December

Handel’s oratorio, “The Mes­
siah,” will be presented in De­
cember, after an interim of two 
years, under the direction of 
Professor Theodore H. Post, in 
the new University of-Nevada 
gymnasium.

A number of students will 
combine their talents with sing* 
ers from Reno, Sparks and Car- 
son City. The chorus will include 
more than 100 people.

The Reno civic chorus and or- 
orchestra presented this famous 
work annually for ten years be­
fore the war. Rehearsals for the 
chorus will be held in the band 
room of the gymnasium on 
Tuesday nights at 7:30. Fifty 
singers attended the first chorus 
rehearsal.

Junior varsity football has 
been dropped for the remainder 
of this season for lack of oppo­
sition in this region. The jayvee 
squad numbered around 35 men 
and the more likely looking pros­
pects were absorbed by the var­
sity squad while the others quit 
for this year.

The jayvees, coached by John­
ny Hatella and Darwin Farns­
worth, played one game, beating 
Lassen Junior College of Susan­
ville 38-0.

Most Complete [ 
and

Up-to-Date Stock ] 
of Toilet Articles ! 

in Nevada

CAMPUS WOMEN 
PARTICIPATE IN 
MANY ACTIVITIES

Observing the number of Girl 
Scout, Campfire Girl and Girl 
Reserve handbooks about the 
campus, one might think that 
the average age of the college 
coed has lowered considerably, 
but such is not the case.

Through YWCA, campus 
women are taking active posi­
tions as advisors to Girl Scout, 
Campfire Girl and Girl Reserve 
groups. Students in charge of 
Campfire Girls are Rosa Camp­
bell, Sue Pierson, Pat Furchner, 
Georgia Lee, Marge Kelley, Eve 
Biglieri and Jeanne Walker. 
Dorothy Brigman and Joylin 
Johnson are leading Girl Scout 
troops and Joylin Johnson also 
has charge of a Girl Reserve 
group.

Credit on YWCA memberships 
is given for this activity, Bar­
bara Thompson, YWCA secre­
tary, stated.

Upperclass men are still out 
for parking violators.

THE GRAND CAFE
Meals a la Supreme

EVENING DINNERS CHOICEST SANDWICHES
—OPEN DAY AND NIGHT—

33 East Second Street Reno, Nevada

A COMPLETE STATEWIDE BANKING SERVICE

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
OF NEVADA
MAIN OFFICE—RENO 

BRANCHES — Reno, Elko, Carson City, Winnemucca, Fallon, 
Sparks, Tonopah, Yerington, Las Vegas, Eureka

Member of 
Federal Reserve System

Stationery 
School Supplies

We Can Supply 
Your Every Need

DONATES BOOKS

Elsa Sameth, head of the de­
partment of physical education 
for women, has donated a num­
ber of books to the University 
of Nevada library, announced 
Miss Clara Johnson, library cata­
loguer, today.

Among those donated are 
“Twelve Hours of Hyg’iene,” 
“Organic Chemistry,” “Dawn 
Over the Amazon,” “The Fight­
ing American,” “Modern Ski 
Technique,” and “Lincoln’s 
Wife.”

Pugilists, join the varsity.

Nevada
Tranfer & 

Warehouse Co

Phone 4191

Member of the Federal
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Gaucho’s Record
Not Impressive;
1 Win, 4 Losses

200 Pound Line Plus
Swift Backfield 
Fail to Pay Off

Independents Adopt 
‘Barb’ Designation

Although organized indepen­
dents have been known as Barbs 
for many years, there was noth­
ing official about this title until 
last week’s meeting when mem­
bers of the organization decided 
to adopt Barbs as their legal 
name.

i “Barbs is an abbreviation of 
J the word barbarian to distinguish 

run - the group ’ from the civilizedIf the law of averages
true to form, the Santa Barbara > Greeks on the hill,” President 
Gauchos should win another ball j Charles Lockart revealed.
game this season. So far the |
Gaucho eleven has made a sad j Next on the Santa Barbara 
showing, losing four and win- agenda was that powerhouse 
ning only one of its five starts.1 team from down southern Cali- 
“In spite of the fact that the ! fOrnia way, Fresno State. Fres- 

Santa Barbara lads have a 200 ‘ no took the measure of the Gau- 
pound line and a swift backfield i chos and put th6m on ice, 20-7, 
they have failed to show any before the day was over.
of then potential power against । LaSf week the Staters tangled 
the opposition, says Coach Jake w£th the San Jose State grid 
Lawlor. j team and again came out second

best, 20-0. This defeat at the 
hand-s of San Jose ran the total 
losses to four.

Because the Gauchos have lost 
four of their five encounters does 
not mean that they don’t have 
any outstanding players. The 
Green and White have some for­
midable looking men in their 
lineup and a few stars. Sam 
Cathart, 170 pound halfback is 
a big gun in the backfield along 
with big, 200 pound fullback 
Miller who was all conference at 
Santa Monica Junior College.

One member of the Santa 
Barbara squad who has been out 
of the lineup for sometime be­
cause of injuries, halfback Max 
Diamond, will be in shape to 
play this Saturday against the 
Wolf Pack.

Head Coach Stan Williamson’s 
gridiron warriors did what was 
expected of them the first game 
of this season and handed a rug- 

’ged California Poly Tech elev­
en a 19-0 beating. This victory 
promised better things to come. 
The following week the Staters 
lost a close one to Loyola 7-0.

Smashed by COP
The Gauchos were smashed 

20-0 in their third encounter by 
a wild running College of 
Pacific team which is coached by 
Alonzo A. Stagg, the venerable 
grid mentor who has shown his 
football wizardry many times 
before.

EMPORIUM OF MUSIC
“Home of Conn 

Band Instruments’’
Phone 3452

214 Sierra Street Keno Keep your feet dry and your 
collar turned high.

ONDEl
Where Coeds Shop to Be Fashionable

135 North Virginia Street Phone 6661---- --- ------------?
- ............................................-..................... ................. ‘ ' " ' ---------- ------------- ----------------------------------------------

NEVADA SHOE FACTORY
SPINA & SON

The Home of

EXPERT SHOE REPAIRING and DYEING 
INVISIBLE SOLING FEATURE

First and Sierra Streets Reno, Nevada

AND THE CHAMPION WINS AGAIN /

COSTMER TOBACCOS

THEY FELL FOR IT BEAUTIFULLY.
LOIS. THEY'LL NEVER ______ -

K CATCH US NOW/

IF CAME LT ARE W 
r FIRST WITH ME 

ON EVERY COUNT/ 
THEY ALWAYS TASTE

GOOP/

YOUR “T-ZONE” 
WILL TELL YOU..

T for Taste...T for Throat 
that's your proving ground 

for any cigarette. See if 
Camels don’t suit your 
“T-Zone” to a “T.”

► NICE ACTING, 
GIRLS/ WE'RE HEAPING 

FOR THE FINISH 
LINE/ J®

CAMELS ARE 
. EASY ON MY 

THROAT- ANO 
TOPS FOR TASTE 
THEY SUIT ME

TO A *7'

THAT WAS A WELL-EARNED J I SEE YOU ALSO 
VICTORY, YOUNG WOMAN ) SMOKE CAMELS, 

............ ------------------------MISS MACINTYRE

AMEL'Olrl 1»A»

TACK

SKIPPER MACINTYRE IS BLANKETED BY THE LEADER IN A RACE OF ATLANTIC (3OFT.)CLASS BOATS

THEY'RE 
FOOTING ON 
US EVERY 

k SECOND .
/ NO LUCK, 5 
* LOIS. THEY ' 
TACKED RIGHT

WITH US/

OR IX SHE 7 NO/
F IT'S A FEINT TACK— 

THAT MACINTYRE 
GIRL IS A REAL 
CHAMPION

WEIGHS 
l*g ONLy 98 POUNDS, 

A J? BUT NATIONAL 
r7 WOMEN'S SAILING 
f CHAMPION LOIS 
" MACINTYRE IS A 
|i KEEN CONTENDER 
i' IN ANY RACE./

SHE'S STILL BLANKETED BY NO. 101 
— NOW SHE'S GOING OFF 
] ON ANOTHER w------—’

GOT
AN IDEA—THE 

TRICK WE USED IN 
THE NATIONAL—MAKE IT GOOD/

R, J. Reynolds Tobacco Company, Winston-Salem, NortKCarolina

TO GET OUT FROM 
OF OPPONENT'S 
MACINTYRE (2 6} CALLS 
ORDER. TO TACK.
OOES THROUGH
OF TACKING, BUT 
OPPONENTdOlJALSO 
TO KEEP HER 
COVERED — SHE 
FALLS SACK ON 
HER. ORIGINAL 
COURSE AND 
GET5 INTO 
CLEAR BEFORE 
OPPONENT 
DISCOVERS

THE 
TRICK

Size of Campus
Is Big Advantage 
Mobley Declares

Dean of Women Recalls
Small Town Days 
In Nevada City

There are ’ unlimited oppor­
tunities for growth and develop 
ment at the University pf Neva­
da, both for individual students 
and for groups, in the opinion of 
Miss Elaine Mobley, who this 
fall was named dean of women.

Nevada’s small size is a dis­
tinct advantage in this respect, 
Miss Mobley believes, and point­
ed out that each student can find 
a place in some activity in which 
he or she is interested, making 
for a full, well-adjusted social 
life important to any individual.

Born and reared in Nevada 
City, California, in the pictur­
esque mother lode country, Miss 
Mobley recalls with keen appre­
ciation the small town freedom 
of her school days.

Nevada City Grad
After being graduated from 

Nevada City high school, she 
attended the University of Cali­
fornia at Berkeley, receiving her 
bachelor of science degree there.

With such a typically western 
background, Miss Mobley has a 
ready understanding of and sym­
pathy for problems of the Ne­
vada undergraduate. Her first 
teaching experience was as 
physical education instructor in 
Placer union high school, where 
she was also dean of girls and 
student counselor.

Placer’s First Dean
When Placer Junior College 

was opened, Miss Mobley was 
made dean of women, a position 
she held for ten years. In addi­
tion to her bachelor’s degree, 
Miss Mobley has done addition­
al work at the University of 
Oregon and Mills College, and 
has completed a master of arts 
degree in educational psycholo-

THE 
WONDER SHOP

Takes You

‘ROUND THE 
CAMPUS”

KOH
EVERY 

WEDNESDAY 
EVENING
7:30 PM.

McGoogle Men 
Plan Steak Fry 
At Galena Creek

Student residents of McGoo­
gle Hall and their guests will 
migrate to the picnic grou'nds at 
Galena creek lodge this evening 
for a steak fry.

“We estimate a crowd of ap­
proximately 80 men and women 
to invade the grounds and we 
are trucking a piano to the scene 
in order to provide entertain­
ment to go with the steaks and 
liquid refreshments,” said 
Charles Lockart, publicity direc­
tor for the McGoogle barracks 
group.

At last Monday evening’s 
meeting of the 40 university men 
who reside in McGoogle Hall on 
Highland Terrace, the picnic 
was planned along with other 
future social functions to pro­
vide entertainment for this group 
of veteran students.

“This is the .first social event 
staged by the McGoogle gang 
for this year, but there are lots 
more coming,” Lockart prom­
ised.

Meeh, Engineers 
Elect Officers 
At Recent Meeting

At a recent American Society 
of Mechanical Engineers meet­
ing, held in the Engineer­
ing building’, election of officers 
took place, James Glynn, pub­
licity director for the organiza­
tion, disclosed today.

Newly elected officers for the 
student branch of ASME were: 
president, Charles Breese; vice- 
president, Bernard Brady; sec­
retary, Charles McKenna; treas­
urer, Wallace Birdsall, and rep­
resentative to the Associated En­
gineers, Walter Riggle.

During the meeting, student 
participation programs came in 
for lengthy, discussion said Di­
rector Glynn. After the business 
of the day was transacted, re­
freshments were served.

gy, counseling and guidance at 
California.

Miss Mobley was appointed" 
dean of women by Dr. John O. 
Moseley, president of the univer­
sity, last July. Prior to that time, 
Mrs. Alice B. Marsh had been 
acting dean of women, follow­
ing the death in 1943 of Dean 
Lucile Benson who served less 
than a year after the retirement 
of Dean Margaret E. Mack, dean 
of women for about 25 years.

The new dean is a member of 
the California Association of 
Women Deans and Vice-Princi­
pals and of the National Asso'

Manzanita lake is due for 
a freeze—get out the skates and 
sharpen ’em, please.

William Holmes
Collection Given 
U of N Library

Autographed Novels, Plays, 
Poems Included in 
Valuable Gift

A rare collection of plays, 
poems and novels belonging to 
the late Professor William Olm­
stead Holmes of the English de­
partment at the University of 
Nevada, has been presented to 
the university library by Mrs. 
Holmes in his memory. The col­
lection consists of writings 
which were the favorites of Pro­
fessor Holmes.

Many of the rare copies now 
in the library are first editions 
and are autographed by the au­
thors.

Among the most valuable edi­
tions donated by Mrs. Holmes 
are John Milton’s “Paradise Re­
gained,” which was printed by 
the famous Dove Press at Ham­
mersmith, England, in 1905, and 
is bound in vellum; and “Psahni 
Penicenciales,” which was writ­
ten in Glouster, England, in 
1440 and printed at the Kelm- 
scott Press on November 15, 
1894.

Other donations were “Public

Distributors of
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STEAKS

Dancing from 9 p. m.
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4

Now Featuring Jack Stephan
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ALWAYS WELCOME!

Speech,” poems by Archibald 
McLeish and ‘‘The King’s 
Henchman,” by Edna St. Vincent 
Millay.

‘‘Public Speech” was one of 
Mr. Holmes’ favorite poems. 
This edition is limited to 275 
signed and numbered copies.

“The King’s Henchman,” a 
play in three acts, is an artist’s 
edition printed from type on Tus­
cany handmade paper and is lim­
ited to 500 copies autographed 
by the author.

Other books donated by Mrs. 
Holmes are autographed copies 
of work by John Steinbeck, “The 
Conquistador,” by McLeish; 
“Borchester Towers,” by An­
thony Trollope'; “Green Man­
sions,” by W. H. Hudson; “The 
Oxbow Ihcident,” by Walter 
Van Tilberg Clark ; “The League 
of Frightened Philistines,” by 
James Farrell.

135 West Second St. Phone 2-2168

R. HERZ & BRO., Inc
JEWELESR

THE FINEST
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MATH CLUB TO MEET
A Math Club meeting will be 

held in room 222 of Mackay Sci­
ence Hall November 14 at 7 :30 
pm. Students who will speak at 
this gathering are Leonard Katz 
and Sinclair Melner, stated Bet­
ty Tracy, president.

Refreshments will be served 
following the talks.

RENO
IRON WORKS

Established in Reno 
Since 1909

WELDING IN ALL 
ITS BRANCHES

234 Chestnut Phone 3671

APPUANCEOJnc.
^ecokjshop
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Open Daily 5 P. M. Dining Room 6 P. M.
PHONE 4850
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FRESNO STATE
MEN FAY VISIT

Discuss Bulldog Status 
In Negro Question

Announcement of Fresno State 
College’s student support of the 
stand the University of Nevada 
has taken toward the Nevada- 
Mississippi State game was made 
through a telegram from George 
Zenovich, student body presi­
dent of Rresno State, to Hans 
Wolfe, ASUN president.

The telegram also notified 
Hans Wolfe of the arrival in 
Reno last Sunday of four stu­
dents, Ed Owensby, Dos Dorf- 
meiere, Leland Scott and Mic­
key Wade, on a friendly visit 
as representatives of their stu­
dent body.

In his telegram, George Zeno­
vich reviewed the situation in 
which Fresno State found itself 
when the college student body 
voted unanimously to cancel its 
Oklahoma City University- 
Fresno State College football 
game because of Oklahoma 
City’s refusal to accept their Ne­
gro athletes. Because of difficul­
ties partly due to the lateness of 
action, the game was not can­
celled.
The telegram contineu : “We sin­
cerely hope you will be success-
f
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SANTA BARBARA
ROOTERS WILL 
ARRIVE FOR GAME

A telegram from Dick 
Brines, Santa Barbara State 
College student body presi­
dent, to Hans W o 1 f e, 
ASUN president, states that 
the majority of Santa Bar­
bara State rooters will ar­
rive Saturday morning, No­
vember 9, for the football 
game, and as many as pos­
sibly can make it will at­
tend the rally and dance on 
Friday night, November 8.

Dick Brines, in the tele­
gram, thanked the univer­
sity for the invitation ex­
tended to Santa Barbara 
State students to attend the 
rally and dance.

ful in your stand for equality 
and tolerance for all races. Your 
support of your Negro athletes’ 
participation in the Nevada-Mis- 
sippi State game will be a step 
applauded by all Americans.

“To show our active interest 
in your stand, we are sending 
Ed Owensby, Don Dorfmeiere, 
Leland Scott and Mickey Wade 
to represent the student body 
of Fresno State and to help you 
in any way they are'able. They 
will arrive by private chartered 
plane about 5 pm Sunday. Please 
keep us notified of your prog­
ress. We are all on your side.”

Gene Mastroianni, assistant 
graduate manager, and Hans 
Wolfe met the plane and stu­
dents. The Fresno State repre­
sentatives were shown the uni­
versity’s hospitality in very way 
possible, Hans Wolfe said. As 
they left by plane on Monday 
afternoon, the me nexpressed 
their appreciation for the way 
in which they had been received 
here and extended an invitation 
to all University of Nevada stu­
dents to visit Fresno State Col­
lege whenever they are in that 
vicinity.

Pack Takes ‘Cats’ 
In Homecoming 
Football Session__

Statistics Show 
Montana Staters 
Outplayed Nevada

Nevada lost the Homecoming 
game Saturday.

If statistics had paid off and 
if the Montana Bobcats had worn 
a little glue on their hands last 
Saturday, it wouldn’t have been 
took improbable that Reno pa­
pers would have printed that 
statement. Nevada won by 24 
points, 38-14, but the statistics 
show what could have happened.

Nev. MS 
First downs, rushing.... 4 11
Total first downs......... 9 15
Net gains, rushing.......126 234 
Penalties ........    70 45

Here is what did happen.
The Wolf Pack’s first half 

dozen points came after Buster 
McClure blocked a Bobcat punt, 
then Bill Bass drove over from 
the two yard line. Fullback 
Francellini’s attempt for the 
extra point failed when the kick 
was blocked, but the level-head-1 
ed Kalmanir scooped the ball up 
and ran it over for the conver­
sion, 7-0.

Breaks again went against 
Montana when Brooks fumbled 
and Nevada’s Sprague recovered 
on the Bobcat 40. Kalmanir 
caught another of Macrides’ 
passes and scampered over from 
the 20 yard mark. Bass’ conver­
sion was good, 14-0.

Recovers Fumble
Big Buster Tilton recovered 

another Montana fumble on the 
Bobcat 12, setting up the third 
Nevada TD. Lloyd Rude did the 
honors, but Subda’s try for extra 
point failed and the scoreboard 
read 20-0.

On a third break, Bass recov­
ered Miles’ fumble on the Bob­
cat 40, and after a successful 
pass to Subda for a first down, 
Macrides flipped another to 
Beasley on the three, who step­
ped over for the fourth Nevada 
tab. Bass failed again to convert 
and at the halfway mark the 
count was Nevada 26, Montana 
State 0.

Intercepts Pass
After a scoreless third period 

and a surprisingly sloppy show­
ing by the Wolf Pack, MSU’s 
Perrigo intercepted a Nevada 
pass and returned it to the Wolf 
Pack 41. From there it took three 
plays for the Bobcats to shove 
over their first score along with 
a good conversion, 26-7.

Immediately following that 
score came the thrill of the day 
when true-footed Tommy Kal­
manir tucked the Montana kick­
off into his tummy five yards be­
hind his own goal line and took 
it upon himself to r omp 105 
yards to the most deserving six 
points of the game. This time it 
was McClure who missed the 
conversion and the scoreboard 
tallied Nevada 32, Montana 7.

Setting up the last Nevada 
touchdown, Subda returned a

PHILCO

Just Put a Record in 
the Slot and it Plays!

Come in and try this amazing 
new Philco ”1201” Radio- 
Phonograph. No more fussing 
with lids, tone arms, controls 
or needles. It’sjthe new way to 
play records invented by Philco. 
Come early. Stock is limited.

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

KINNEAR STANDINGS

Sigma Nu ....................112.5
Lambda Chi Alpha .... 66.17 
Alpha Tau Omega .... 63.75 
Sigma Alpha Epsilon 21.00 
Phi Sigma Kappa .... 13.75 
Sigma Rho Delta  6.17 
Theta Chi ................. 1.17

punt to the Wolf Pack 40, 
whence the Macrides - Hayes 
corribination went to work for 
two long gains. Eliades later 
squirmed over the Bobcat line 
from the three. It was Rude’s 
turn to miss the conversion, 38-7.

Finally, after a series of long 
gains by a still scrappy Bobcat 
squad, quarterback Bourdet 
sneaked over from the Nevada 
three for the last TD of the 
game. The conversion was good 
and the score at the sound of 
the gun was 38-14, Nevada.

Take your fall sniffles to the 
doc,

Don’t spread your colds 
throughout the flock.
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CHESTERFIELD SUPPER CLUB 
ALL NBC STATIONS

SMOKING
PLEASURE

ALUMNI SPURS
STUDENT UNION
BUILDING PLANS

Hope for a new Student Union 
building was renewed this week 
when alumni donations to the 
building fund spurted after last 
week’s Homecoming festivities.

Dr. John O. Moseley, univer­
sity president, spoke about 'the 
need for the building at the an­
nual alumni dinner at the Dutch 
Gardens Saturday. He cited the 
great increases in enrollment this 
year and the consequent inade­
quacy of the present building. 
Three or four checks were writ­
ten at the banquet and were con­
tributed to the building fund. 
The amounts of money involved 
were not disclosed.

More than 400 attended this 
year’s banquet, reported Rex 
Daniels, alumni association sec­
retary, making it “the largest 
alumni banquet so far.” Among 

those present was Governor Vail 
Pittman.

Mr. John Chism, retiring presi­
dent of the alumni association, 
was master of ceremonies at the 
banquet and Mr. John Benson 
was in charge of arrangements 
for the banquet.

Fisticuffs Taught

Anyone on the campus who 
wants to box or learn to box 

........................................................... ■ --.........—........................................................................................

Compliments
A. BENNETTI NOVELTY 

C. INC.

125 East Second Street Phone 7575

..............- . ...................................-

will be interested to know that 
afternoon boxing classes will be 
held in the gymnasium, report­
ed Jim Bailey, boxing coach, to­
day. “We have a big varsity 
schedule this year and want ev­
erybody who can box to parti­
cipate if possible,” he continued.

All men who want to box will 
have to bring their own practice 
equipment until such time as 
more is available.

Learn boxing in gym sessions.
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Students Back at Books This Week 
After Gala Homecoming Celebration

With students cracking their 
books again for the first time 
since festivities started, the 27th 
Homecoming ebbs into a mem­
ory.

Norma Carruth, who reigned 
as queen of the three-day cele­
bration, made A. Millard one of 
the happiest students on the cam­
pus when she drew his winning- 
ticket from the cement mixed to 
make him owner of the green 
Buick car. Presentation of the 
car and other prizes awarded by 
the alumni association was made 
during the half time period of 
the game between the Wolf Pack 
and Montana State in Mackay 
stadium.

Approximately 7000 cold but 
excited fans watched Tommy 
Kalmanir make his spectacular 
105-yard run for a touchdown 
as a highlight of the 38-14 Pack 
trouncing of the Montana State 
eleven.

Top Prize
Pi Beta Phi sorority received 

the top prize for their Wolves 
Frolic skit which featured a 
Scottish theme; the Sigma Al-

Moltzen & Fitch 
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pha Epsilon fraternity carted off 
the men’s trophy for the most 
original men’s play depicting 
“swooning” Frankie Sinatra, 
and the Sagers were awarded the 
trophy for the best' organization 
skit with “The Men in Her Life.”

A packed house at the Grana­
da theater more than compensat­
ed for the effort expended by the 
16-girl kick chorus, university 
choir members, skit casts from 
sororities, fraternities and other 
organizations, and Frolic Direc­
tor Miss Janice Swan and As­
sistant Director Miss Tosca 
Masini.

Float Honors
Top honors for floats in the 

Saturday parade were divided 
between the Delta Delta Delta 
sorority, the Lambda Chi fra­
ternity and the Alpha Epsilon 
Deltas. All three groups receiv­
ed trophies for the most original 
floats.

On Friday evening the band 
and students wound their way 
through downtown Reno in the 
annual pa jamboree which ended 
at the university stadium where 
a pep rally was held. Because of 
the high winds Friday evening 
the huge collection of scrap lum­
ber slated for the bonfire was 
not ignited. Intentions were to 
save the mammoth bonfire for 
the rally this evening preceding 
the Santa Barbara football game 
tomorrow, but someone sneaked 
a light into the pile last Satur­
day evening. Nothing left but 
ashes now.

Alumni Banquet
Attending the alumni banquet

Reno, Nevada

Virginia and Douglas Alley

Blue Key to Hold 
Dance in New Gym 
After Game Rally

Jim, Borge, president of Blue 
Key, has announced that the or­
ganization will sponsor a dance 
at the new gym immediately fol­
lowing the rally this evening. 
Jim Glynn and George Voss are 
in charge of arrangements.

Blue Key tryees who helped as 
ushers for the Wolves Frolic 
have been commended by 
Borge and members of 
Homecoming committee 
their work on behalf of 
Homecoming celebration.

Jim 
the 

for 
the

Tryees assisting were Henry 
Stewart, Rex Ricketts, Gordon 
Hawkins, Lyman Schwartz, Har­
old Dale, Marion Itza, Robert 
Summer, Barnes Berry, Orsie 
Graves, Ben Lewis, Mario Isola, 
Gene Tidball, Hal Tognoni, Dan 
Rice, David Yparraguirre, Ray 
Early and Hans Wolfe. Members 
assisting were Lyle Roush and 
Ed Beauport.

COLDS PREVALENT, BUT 
NO ONE HOSPITALIZED

All was quiet in the infirmary 
last week.

Although colds were preval­
ent among students, and a con­
stant stream of coughing and 
snuffling men and women went 
through Dr. George R. Magee’s 
office, no one was sick enough 
to be hospitalized.
ORCHESIS TO PAY DUES

Orchesis members will have 
to pay dues hereafter, it was de­
cided at a business meeting of 
senio Orchesis today, announc­
ed Miss Jacqueline Van Baas- 
beek, advisor, for the Nevada 
chapter of the national dance 
club.

at Dutch Gardens Saturday eve­
ning, 400 alumni gathered to 
talk over old school days after 
they had toured fraternity and 
sorority rows where houses 
opened their doors for the 
grads.

An estimated 800 couples 
danced to Jan Savitt’s Top Hat­
ters in the new gymnasium as 
the finale to the exciting week­
end. Awards were made during 
the evening to groups as prizes 
for their efforts in making Home- 
coming 1946 a success.

From Thursday evening at 9 
o’clock when Phi Sigma Kappa 
fraternity was host at the tradi­
tional street dance until 1:00 
Sunday morning, students and 
grads of the university partici­
pated in the most spectacular 
and spontaneous celebration in 
the 70-year history of the school.

Get to work on your Mackay 
Day choral skits.

Moseley Relates 
Building Status

(Continued from Page 1) 
most influential wiles on mem­
bers of the Nevada legislature to 
open their eyes to the immediate 
needs of the university and to 
the present shocking inadequai- 
cies in most of the departments.

Following the discussion of 
the building program members 
of the improvements committee 
decided to hold a special meeting 
next Tuesday afternoon to map 
out a definite program to pre­
sent to the student body in Wed­
nesday morning’s assembly. 
“This is a badly needed program 
and one that warrants the sup­
port of the entire student body. 
Make it a definite date on your 
calendar to be present at the 
assembly at 11 :15 am this Wed­
nesday,” concluded Stewart, 
committee chairman.

PROFESSORS URGED 
TO ORDER BOOKS

Because of a growing scarcity 
of text books, University of Ne­
vada professors and instructors 
are being urged to order now the 
books they will need for their 
classes during the spring semes­
ter, Ralph Jordon, proprietor of 
the University Book Store, said 
today.

Orders for spring semester 
texts have already been placed 
by Pacific coast schools. Be­
cause of their orders, the stocks 
at the west coast supply houses 
are depleted. If not ordered in 
the near future, the texts, which 
must be secured from the east, 
will not be available for spring 
semester classes, Jordon pointed 
out.

OFFICERS ELECTED AT
CANTERBURY CLUB MEET

Alyn Brennen, freshman arts 
and science student, was elected 
president of the Canterbury 
Club at a meeting Wednesday 
evening.

Other officers of the group 
chosen were Marjorie Keen, vice- 
president ; Alice Williams, sec­
retary, and Norma Moody, treas­
urer.

Following the business meet­
ing, Bishop Lewis gave an in­
teresting talk on the new mar­
riage canon recently passed at 
general convention.

GYM SPACE SHORTAGE 
SUSPENDS WRA SPORTS

Inadequate gym space will 
force the suspension of most 
WRA activities this year, report­
ed Jacqueline Van Gaasbeek, 
women’s PE advisor. Basketball 
and volley ball, for instance, 
have been taken off the sched­
ule. Bowling, golf and swimming 
will go on as usual because they 
are played off the campus.

Tennis tournaments were com­
pleted last week with Fay Fry- 
berger and Lois Hitchens win­
ning.

MRS. SIBURG VISITS
PI BETA PHI CHAPTER

Mrs. William Siburg, newly 
appointed president for Mu prov­
ince of Pi Beta Phi, visited Ne­
vada Alpha chapter this week.

Mrs. Siburg is making a series 
of visits to chapters throughout 
the province. She arrived in 
Reno on Wednesday and left' 
Thursday.

“Did you do much fighting 
during the last war, pa?”

“I did my share of it, sonny.”
“Did you mjake the enemy 

run?”
“Yes, my boy, I certainly did,” 
“And did they catch you, pa?”
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